MISC. ORDER NO._2619- 77

In the County Court of Craighead County, Arkansas

In the matter of awarding bids for double chip seal of various roads in Craighead
County

Order

Comes before the county court the matter of awarding bids for the purchase of oils
and chips to be applied to various county roads as the roads are made ready by the
Craighead County Road Department. All materials, equipment, application
procedures, insurances, safety and all other related aspects shall meet or exceed all
bid specifications in bid package 2017-22 and shall be furnished by vendor.

Bids were advertised and publicly opened in accordance with Arkansas code 14-22-
101 through 14-22-115 concerning public bidding,.

It is therefore considered, ordered and adjudged that the low total bid of $62,812.28
for double chip seal various county roads in Craighead County be accepted from
Cummings Chip Sealing, Inc., 79 Sprout Springs Road, Batesville, AR 72401. Total
price double chip seal of 5785 feet of county roads and includes $15,721.03 for
Prime coat MC30, $4.03 per gallon; $33,930.00 for CRS-2P, $3.48 per gallon;
$7,261.25 for Mineral aggregate (class 2), $39.25 per ton; $2,500.00 for maintenance
of traffic, and $3,400.00 for mobilization.

Y2
Dated This. ] 7" Day of July, 2017 FILED

JUL 19 2017
KADE HOLLIDAY

COUNTY & FROBATE COURT GLERK

Approved:

Ed Hill
Craighead County Judge
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Craighead County, Arkansas

Chip seal bid package 2016-23

Bid Tabulaticn July 13,2017 - - - L
Al Haines ~ _
Ph 870-933-4500 } : i ;
Clever Stone Co., Inc Aflas Asphalt, Inc (APAC-Missour, inc. Salt Creek Paving Cummings Chip Sealing, Inc  {Asphalt Producers, LLC
1075 Wise Hill Road PQ Boex 2500 4580 W Calhoun 1525 Mary Kay Blivd 79 Spout Springs Rd PO Box 1492
! Clever MO 65631 Jonesbeoro, AR 72401 ‘Springfield, MO 65802 Benton, AR 72018 Batesville, AR 72501 Jonesboro, AR 72403
‘ Mike Donaldson/Scott Brian Fulkerson iDave Clark Richard Christian Bill Cummings John Broadaway
Ph 417-838-5118 ‘Ph 932-1246: Ph 471-868-6700 Ph 601-315-6833 Ph 870-834-0391 Ph 870-932-1306
Fax 417-743-2945 Fax 935-6687 Fax 417-868-6790 Fax 501-315-6838 Fax 870-251-3333 Fax 870-932-1554
T { _
Quantity _ Unit Price| Total Cost | Unit Price| Total Cost | Unit Price._Total Cost | Unit Pricel _Total Cost | Unit Price] Total Cost | Unit Price] Total Cost
Prime Coat (MC-30) 3,901 1$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 :$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.03 '$15,721.03_ [$0.00 $6.00
Poly Mod Cat Emul (CRS-2F 9,750 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.48 $33,930.00  [$0.00 $0.00
Mineral Aggregate (Class 2) 185 $0.00 $0.00 '$C.00 '$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $39.25 |$7,261.25 $0.00 $0.00 |
Maintenance of Traffic 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,500.00 |$2,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 a
Mobilization 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $C.00 $0.00 {$0.00 $3,400.00 |$3,400.00 $0.00 $0.00
. _ $0.00 $0.00 1$0.00 : $0.00 ,w §62,812.28 $0.00
L No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid ,w _ No Bid




| ’ CRAIGHEAD COUNTY]| | | ]
__INVITATION TO BID-Not an Order

| L ] L[ |

511 Union St. Suite 119
Jonesboro, Arkansas 72401

|

PURCHASING OFFICE

BIDNO. 201722 B DATE June 27, 2017
Sealed blds_ subject to the conditions on the attached hereof, and as may be attached hereto, wil} be received at this office

until 2:00 PM July 1 377201777 and then publicly opened, for furnishing the supplies, materials, o
and/or services as described below.

Bids will be opened July 13 2017 _
_2.00PM

F.O.B Job Site, Craighead County. Arkansas - BY: Al Haines |
All work awarded under this bid must be completed by September 15, 2017, PURCHASING DIRECTOR
in accordance with the current AHTD specifications. '

| Item # | DESCRIPTION
1 The intent of the attached specifications is to provide bidders with the scope to govern
workmanship of the related projects and to attest to the materials used on the prOJects located
in Craighead County. | t
2 |The successful bidder will furnish Craighead County with a signed
copy of all delivery receipts and quantmes of mg(( ials used on each road.
3 Does bidder meet all specifications? Yes__ No
If no, please attach sheets explaining dlfferences
4  |Bid price shall remain firm for 30 days from bid opening.
5 |Bidder should submit a list of references with similar county applications.
6  |Bidder should specify approximate start date if awarded bid.
Days LAte - Hug,
7 Bid must be signed by an authorized epresentative or bid will be rejected.
8 | Bidder should return all 4 pages of this bid package.
9 Bid # 2017-22 must be noted on the outside of bidders envelope.
0 |Bidder shall specify any cash discounts, if available.
1 Successful bidder shall supply county with proof of |labl|lty and workers comp

TOTAL BID FOR AWARD CONSIDERATION- $

EXECUTION OFBID L e
bate 7727 |

We, the undersigned, have read all the requirements set forth in this bid proposal including specifications
conditions, and pertinent information regarding the articles being bid on, and we agree to furnish
articles at the prices instructions, stated.

I

Arkansa use Tax Reister No.

4

¥

(Persgahuthorized to"Slgn Bids) ©

M@-/

~ JSIGNED BIDS WILL BE REJECTED ' _
__Ble ARE SUBJECT TO REJEGTION UNLESS SUBMITTED ON THIS FORM
NOTICE TO BIDDERS, SEE REVERSE SIDE OR ATTACHMENTS FOR INSTRUCTIONS AND CONDITIONS.

| I N




CRAIGHEAD COUNTY

JONESBORO, ARKANSAS

F

|
_____ CONDITIONS OF BIDDING

Compliance with the following conditions is necessary for consmieratlon of this bid.

Signature-This bid must be signed with the firm name and by an authorized offcer “employee or agent,

2 Contractors are to include all costs into the bid price, including applicable taxes. |
3 Freight and other dehverv charges-to destinatlon at deS|gnated County facmty in the County must be |ncluded in bid,
- Charges may not be added after the bid is opened. S ]
|4 |Discounts-Show rate, total amount, and Jatest day any discounts will be allowed after receipt of article and | invoice, T
otherwise County will deduct allowed dlscount when payment is made |
& |Firm Price- All prices quoted will remain firm for 30 days, unless atherwise specified
by the County or bidder. \
__6___|Identical Bids- In the event of two or more identical low bids, the contract may be awarded arbitrarily or for
- any reason to any of such bidders, or split in any proportion between the said two or more bidders at
discretion of the County |
7 Clean up- Complete cleanup and proper dlsposal of any and all job related items is conmdered tobea part of any ]
contract let by Craighead County. | 1 | L o
8 |Ambiguity in bid-Any ambiguity in any bid as the result of omission, error, lack of clarity or non-compliance
specn”catlons instructions, and all conditions of bidding shall be construed in the light most favorable to the County.
9 |Construction | ] ‘
A. When requested, the Contractor is to supply the County with e\ndence of havmg and maintaining proper and
spec:t‘ cally Workman's Compensation Insurance in accordance W|th the laws of the State of Arkansas, |
~|Public Liability, and Property Damage. Al premiums and cost shall be paid by Contractor In no way will the
| |County be responsible in case of accident. [
B.A Performance Bond equaling t_lje_total amount ¢ of any bid exceeding $20,000 must be provided for i
erectnon of any public building, public structure, or pubhc |mprovement(Pursuant to Arkansas Code 18- 44 503, )
10 IThe County reserves the right to reject any and all bids, accept in whole or in part, to waive informalities in bids
received, to accepl bids on materials or equipment W|th variations from specifi catlons in thase cases where efficiency
of operation will not be impaired, and unless otherwrse specified by bidder, to accept any item in the bid. If unit prices
and extensions thereof do not coincide, the County may accept the bid for the lesser amount whether reflected
g | by extension or by the correct mul_t_|p_le of the unit price. N
I - INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
' (Please read carefully) o
1 |Submit bid on bid form attached or reverse side of this sheet. {
2 |Address all bids to; Purchasing D|recftgr Cralghead County Judge's Office, 511 Unlon St Suute 118,
Jonesboro, Arkansas 72401 and make certain to indicate identifying bid number on the outside of bid envelope.
3__ |DO NOT include Federal Excise Tax in bid. County will furnish exemption certificate. L j
4___ [Sate Manyfacturer, Brand Name, Model, etc, for each item bid on.
5  |Samples of items, when required must be furnished free, and, if not called for w1th|n 30 days from date of
. bid opening, will be disposed of by the County. i o
6 [Bids received after stated time will not be considered. T '
7 _ |Be sure and read alt conditions and verify amounts before submitting bids. No changes or additions will be
allowed after submission, T -
8 Guargnt_ee_ga_n_d warranties should be attached as a part of the bid, as they may be a consideration )
in awarding contract. B
9 _ |Delivery or contract completion time is to be shown, as this date may, where time is of the

essence, determine the contract award.

Additional information may be obtained from the Purchasing Department,

THE COUNTY RESERVES THE RIGHT 70 ACCEPT PART OR ALL OF ANY SPECIFIG BID OR BIDS

AND TO ACCEPT BID_WITH OR WITHOUT TRADE-IN, AND REJECT ANY AND ALL BIDS.




SPECIFICATIONS [ T | ] |

Scope: To furnish and lay single and double chip seal coat ing materials to Craighead County, Arkansas on various

county roads as specified

These figures are approximate. Please look at the jobs and submif bids accordingly.

Craighead County stipulates that the successful bldder will do other chip seal jobs at the hid price, should

other monies become available fo Craighead County,

’ | p—— | — -

Craighead County reserves the right to accept, reject, in whole or in part, to waive informalities in bids

received, or accept bids with variations.

Single and Double Chip. Seal Specaf cations

1.0 Descnptson T

1.1 | This work consists of single and double Chlp sealing county roads., Single coat chip seal shall be applled to exnstlng
blacktop roads or specified aggregate base roads. A prime coat and single or double chip seal shall be applied

as specified to aggregate base roads as fumished, shaped, and compacted by Craighead County Highway Dept.

Note: Bidders may contact Eugene Neff at the Craighead County Road Department at 870- 933-451 0 for specifics on road locati

and part of roads to be chip sealed.

Craighead County 2017 Chip Seal Bid Proposal ' )_ - T -

Arkansas Slate Highway and Transportation Department (AHTD) specifications will be used in bidding Craighead

County's chip seal projects. The Construction Requirements will adhere to Section 402 and the Materials and | R

Equipment will adhere to Sechon 403 of the Standard Specifications for Highway Constructlon AHTD Edition of 204 or

the latest EHTD Edition. I f | | \

MC-30 wilt be used for the prime coat application, CRS-2P will be used as the liquid asphalt in the chip seal application,

and Class 2 Mineral Aggregate will be used as the cover aggregate in the chip seal application. In the case of adouble
Chlp seal application, the second seal shall be applied the day following application of the first seal, weather permitting.

Sweeping is required after each chip seal application and shall be completed the moming foliowmg each appltcatlon

| | | | | i

The MC-30 shall conform to AHTD Section 403.03(b) and must meet the requirements of AASHTO M 82. MC-30

must come from an approved supplier listed ar the AHTD Qualified Producer's List (QPL) and shall be applied in

confermance to AHTD Section 401.03(b). ]

o l 1 -

The CRS-2P shall conform to AHTD Section 403.03(e). CRS-2P must come from an approved supplier listed on

the AHTD Qualified Produce:‘s List (QPL).

| | | _

The Class 2 Mineral Aggregate shall conform to the requirements of AHTD Section 403.01 and the gradation

specifications of Section 403,02,

| L , )

Basis of Payment will adhere to AHTD Section 402.07, Payment will be made under.

Pay Item Pay Unit

Prime Coat (MC-30) Gallon N
Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt (CRS-2P) Gallon

Mineral Aggregate in Asphalt Surface Treatment (Class 2) Ton

Maintenance of Traffic Lump Sum -
Mobilization _ Lump Sum




| Description: | [ | ' ' { ] ]
The intent of the specifications is to provide bidders with the scope to govern workmanship of the related project(s)

and toﬁaﬁesf to the materials used on the project(s) located in Craighead County.
The successful bidder will fumish Craighead Colnty with signed documentation of i delivery receipts and quantities
 used on each road. The prime coat should be applied at a rate of .30 gaflons per square yard, unless the contractor
and county agree upon a different rate for the betterment of the project(s). An Asphalt Surface Treatment design should
 be submitted prior to beginning the first project. This design should detail the CRS-2P and Class 2 Mineral Aggregate
application rates. For the purpose of bidding, a CRS-2P rate of .35 gallons per square yard for the first treatmentand
a rate of 40 gallons per square yard for the second seat shall be used. An aggregate application rate of 28 pounds N
per square yard shall be used. These rates may change based on the results of the Asphalt Surface Treatment Design.
The successful biddt'ar will be paid based on ac[tual quant_itieT used on each project. _ [ I
| S ,, I_. ]
The Pay Unit will be based off of the materials applied in place on each project. This price will include materials,
equipment, labor, insurance, and all ather refated costs, including applicable taxes. '

An authorized representative of each bidder must sign ail bids.,

| | —

The bid may be awarded after stringent review of all factors inciuding, bit not imited to, prics, availabiliy, quality,
performance, workmanship, references, viewing recent and dated jobs of contractor, and other relative factors.

| | U S
2017 Job Detail f Description —;Jf._g N
Craighead County Roads - - —_— ]
Length Width MC-30 CRS-2P | Class 2 Aggregate
Job County Road # (feet) (Feet) Tons Gallons | Gallons | Tog -
A _|Double AST 123_ 2285 20 5 1567 3917 T 75
"B Double AST 781 3500 20 10| 234 588 | ma |
TOTALS: | 578500 18500 | 390100 | 975000 | o0

Craighead County Asphalt Surface Treatment

Selected Sections

The purpose of this project is to seal and/or reseal 5785 feet of various county roads in

Craighead County. This project consists of Asphalt Surface Treatment, Mobilization, and Traffic Gontrol.

Schedule of items
Line # ltem Description Estimated nit Unit Bid Price| ~ Extension

Quantity
""" 1 [Bime Coat (MC-30] 3,901 Gallon | L,03 /8 TXI 63
i 2 |Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt (CRS-2P] 9,750 Galon | 3,48 | 335425, 60
3 Mineral Aggregate in Asphalt Surface Treatment (Class 2) 185 1 Ton 1 39.2 ) j.f
4 |Maintenance of Traffic - ] 1 _Lump Sum 1 4 57 Po 08 '
5 Mobilization 1 Lump Sum | 3 &4 OONBE

TOTAL BID FOR AWARD CONSIDERATIONS

| | |




Craighead County Purchasing Department

Reference: Bid Package 2017-22
Double chip seal various county roads in Craighead County.

This is to certify that only one (1) bid was received in reference to bid 2017-22,
doub Chlp seal county roads.

ﬂ #ﬁ, - Clé an g ‘\) a “Xé &1
./ 4

Al Haines Jeanne Taylor

County Purchasing Agent Secretary to County Judge



Craighead County
Ed Hill County Judge

-

|

——— — Miies £
o 1.5 3 & 9 12

Cadastral data does not represent legal property boundary descriptions, nor is it suitabie for boundary determination
of the individual parcels included in the cadastre.




The Jonesboro Sun

DAILY AND SUNDAY

Proof of Publication

STATE OF ARKANSAS
COUNTY OF CRAIGHEAD

1,_Lisa A. Lynn solemnly swear that [
am classified director of the JONESBORO SUN daily newspaper of general
circulation printed in the Western District of Craighead County and I was such classified

advertising manager at the date of publication hereinafter stated, and that said newspaper had

a bonafide circulationin such county at said dates, and had been regularly published in said county
for the period of one month next belore the date of the first publication of the advertisement herete

affixed, and that said advertisement was published in said

newspaper 1 times once a week for_l

weeks consecutively, the first insertion therein having been made on the

28 day of June, 2017
2nd insertion day of
3rd insertion day of
4th insertion day of
5th insertion day of
6th insertion day of

7th insertion day of //

Lisa A.Lynn é,u}%\\_ 4

3l

b

Sworn to and subscribed before me this ﬁmf T ne, 201y I !

My commission q, (0..& !
expires

b A4

Fee for print, $

Cost of Proof &M__

Rec’d Payment §$
Totdl -~ = § 7930

OFFICIAL SEAL

518 Carson St. Jonesboro, AR 72401 « (870) 935-5525 « FAX (870) 935-1674




https://amp paxtonmedia.com: 8446/ AMPWeb/Temporaryltems/27 ..

CRAIGHEAD COUNTY JUDGES OFFICE
BILLING DEPT

511 UNION STE 119

JONESBORO, AR 72401

(870)933-4500

Class Liner Ad #90669413 Summary:

Description: NOTICE TO BIDDERS Craighead Co
Size: 1.00 x 4.21

Net Cost $79.30
Prepaid Amount  $0.00
Amount Due $79.30

If paid by credit card, your statement will show the charge as "Newspaper Services - Paxton

Media"

Order Detail: | -
gPublication Start : Stop | Insertions

i s

[ 200 Yoneshoro Sun | 628117 62817 1

lof2 o 6/27/17,11:29 AM



202

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
Craighead County is
now accepting bids un-
it 2:00 PM, Juiy 13, 2017,
at the Crailghead
County Judge's office
for the following:
pauble chip seal vari-
pus county roads i
Craighead County,
Arkansas

Bid specifications may
be picked up at the
County Judge's office,
Craighead County
Courthouse Annex, 511
Unlon st., Suite 119,
Jonesbore, Arkansas,
Monday mmwgﬁ Friﬁasﬁ
from 8:00 AM, until 5:00
P.M. or accessed on the
County Web site.

Bids will ke opened at
2:00 PM, July 13, 2017, in
the County Judge's of-
fice.

The County reserves
the right to reject any
and all bids or any part
of any specific bid.

Bid specifications are
available on the County
web 31 i: & at

Al Haines
Purchasing Agent
Cralghead County

- NOTICE 'ro BIDDERS
;-Cralqhead Countv Is
“now:accepting blds.bn-.

“tI-2:00 PM, July 43, 2017,
‘at. the'. Cralghead
County Judge's office

-for the' follo!

md specificatior g
be: picked. .up at.the,
Courtv Judge's: office;
Crdlghead ‘county:
cou 'oUse Annex 511;

r .. __
Un!on 5t., Sulte’ 119;
A
9 i
|from 8:00 AM.: ‘until: 5 0\&
iP.M..or accessed o on'the
County Web Site: i
Bids: will:be' onenad at|
2:00 PM, July 13, 2017, In’

‘ ii:he c0untv Judge s of-
fice.-

iThe: countv reserves]
!the Hght to relect any:"
and ail bids of any part
[ofany specific bid. "

Blg speclﬂcatlons--are
Favalla the:

pt;v% -

https://amp paxtonmedia.com:8446/AMPWeb/Te...

6/27/17,11:29 AM



NOTICE TO BIDDERS,

county s

Craighead County Judge
Craighead County Courthouse Annex

Ed Hill

511 Union, Suite 119

Jonesboro, Arkansas 72401-2836

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

Craighead County is now accepting bids until 2:00 PM, July 13, 2017, at the
Craighead County Judge's office for the fonowmg:

Double chip seal various county roads in Craighead County, Arkansas

Bid specifications may be picked up at the County Judge's office, Craighead
County Courthouse Annex, 511 Union St, Suite 119, Jonesboro, Arkansas,
Monday through Friday, from 8:00 A.M until 5:00 P.M. or accessed on the County

Web Site.

Bids will be opened at 2:00 PM, July 13, 2017, in the County Judge's office.

The County reserves the right to reject any and all bids or any part of any specific

bid.

Bid specifications are available on the County Web Site at

www.craicheadcounty.oeg sivie «
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Purchasing Agent
Cralghea County

Al Haines
Purchasing Agent
Craighead County



